
 

 

              HB 10 
Legal Notice No. 8 of 2023 

 

ST HELENA 

 

 
 

SOCIAL SECURITY ORDINANCE, 2010 

 

SOCIAL SECURITY (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS, 2023 
 

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 17 of the Social Security Ordinance, 2010, 

the Governor in Council makes the following Regulations: 

 

Citation and commencement 

 

 1. These Regulations may be cited as the Social Security (Amendment) Regulations, 

2023. 

 

Rate of Basic Island Pension 

 

2. Regulation 4 of the Social Security Regulations, 2011 is amended by deleting the 

amount “£77.50” in paragraph (1) and substituting “£80.60”. 

 

Basic adult rate 

 

 3. Regulation 7 of the Social Security Regulations, 2011 is amended by deleting the 

amount “£75.00” in paragraph (2) and substituting “£78.00”. 

 

Made by the Governor in Council this 29th day of September 2023. 

 

 

          

         Nigel Phillips CBE 

           Governor 
                                                
                                        ______________________ 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This note is not part of the Regulations) 

 

The purpose of these Regulations is to adjust the rate of the basic island pension and the basic adult rate used for 

purposes of determining the basic island pension and income related benefit payable under the Social Security 

Ordinance, 2010.   

_________________________________________________________________________  
Printed by Printech St Helena Ltd. 

L.S. 


