HB 14
Legal Notice No. 10 of 2021

ST HELENA

PUBLIC HEALTH ORDINANCE, 1939

PUBLIC HEALTH (PREVENTION OF FORMIDABLE DISEASES)
(CORONAVIRUS NO. 2)(AMENDMENT NO. 2) REGULATIONS, 2021

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 49 of the Public Health Ordinance,
1939, the Governor in Council makes the following Regulations:

Citation and interpretation

1. (1) These Regulations may be cited as the Public Health (Prevention of
Formidable Diseases) (Coronavirus No. 2)(Amendment No. 2) Regulations, 2021.

(2) In these Regulations, “the principal Regulations” means the Public Health
(Prevention of Formidable Diseases) (Coronavirus No. 2) Regulations, 2020.

Amendment of regulation 4 - Isolation upon entry

2. Regulation 4 of the principal Regulations is amended by deleting the expression
“14 days” in sub-regulations (1), (2)(a) and (2A) and substituting “10 days”.

Amendment of regulation 6 - Isolation: additional provisions

3. Regulation 6 of the principal Regulations is amended by deleting the expression
“14 days” in sub-regulations (2) and (3) and substituting “10 days”.

Amendment of regulation 10 — Detention

4.  Regulation 10(8) of the principal Regulations is amended by deleting the
expression “14 days” and substituting “10 days”.

Made by the Governor in Council this 17" day of June 2021.

o

gs:%

Connie Johnson
Clerk of Councils



HB 15 No 9 Public Health (Prevention of Formidable Diseases) (Coronavirus
No. 2)(Amendment No. 2) Regulations, 2021.

EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This note is not part of the Regulations)

These regulations amend the Public Health (Prevention of Formidable Diseases) (Coronavirus No. 2)
Regulations, 2020, to reduce the period of compulsory isolation under the Regulation from 14 days to 10 days.

Printed by Printech St Helena Ltd



